Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1082297
Vendor Name: Advanced Technologies Consultants, Inc.

Check Detalils:

Check Number: 0337527
Check Amount: $ 12,296.00
Check Date: 3/26/2025

Invoice Details:

Invoice Number: 24-P0014044
Invoice Date: 11/15/2024

PO Number: P0014044
Voucher Number: V0876033

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



atc

T.S. Enterprise Associates, LLC DBA
Advanced Technologies Consultants
44800 Helm Street | Plymouth, M1 48170

Phone: 800-348-8447

*** Please note our new address above *** \

Sol d To:

Col I ege of Dupage
425 Fawel | Bl vd

Ship To:

Col l ege of Dupage

Invoice

I nvoi ce Nunber:
24-P0014044

| nvoi ce Dat e:
Nov 15, 2024

Page: 1

Attn: Robert Clark

Accts. Payabl e, SRC2049 425 Fawel |
Gen Ellyn, IL 60137 Gen Ellyn, IL 60137-5699
U S. A U S A
Customer |ID Customer PO Paynment Ter nms
COMXOD P0014044 Net 30 Days
Sales Rep ID Shi ppi ng Met hod Ship Date Due Date
REYKC PPD & Add 12/ 15/ 24
Quantity Item Descri ption Unit Price Ext ensi on
1.00 TU- 807, Tabl e-Top Heat Punp 11, 846. 00 11, 846. 00
Training Uhit wlnverter
Conpr essor
1.00|001 Shi ppi ng 450.00 450.00
Subtot al : 12, 296. 00
Sal es Tax:
Total Invoi ce Amount: 12, 296. 00
Recei ved:
TOTAL: 12, 296. 00

NOTE: A 3% PROCESSING FEE WILL BE

ADDED FOR ORDERS PAID BY CREDIT CARD.




Accounts Payable <acctpay@cod.edu>

FW: [External] Fw: 24-P0014044

Accounts Payable <acctpay @cod.edu> Tue, Mar 11, 2025 at 04:57 PM UTC
CC:

BCC:

Marivic Zerrudo
Accounts Payable Specialist

College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd | SRC 2132 | Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599

phone 630-942-2601 | zerrudom@cod.edu

From: Joey Close <joeyclose@atctrain.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 11, 2025 10:08 AM
To: Accounts Payable <acctpay@cod.edu>
Subject: [External] Fw: 24-P0014044

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond
with sensitive information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

From: Joey Close <joeyclose@atctrain.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 11, 2025 11:06 AM




To: invoicing@cod.edu <invoicing@cod.edu>
Subject: 24-P0014044

The information contained in this email and/or attachmentsisintended only for the personal and
confidential use of the intended recipient. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient(s) or
any agent responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient(s), you are hereby notified that you may
have received this document in error. Any review, dissemination, distribution or copying of this message
isstrictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by
telephone or email and delete the original message. Thank you.
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